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To educate students about the actuarial career and provide them with a 
roadmap to career success, Willis Towers Watson conducted a pre-
placement talk on 6th September 2023. 

Garima Chawla, Gayathri Khanna, Priyanka Dudi, Vikky Aggarwal, 
Raghav Sharma, Sakshi Rawat and Tisha Goel were the speakers at the 
event. All the students who had registered participated in the pre-
placement talk. The session started at 10:30 am on Microsoft Teams.  
 

The event began with Garima Chawla, a representative from WTW, 
introducing herself and his colleagues to the audience. The agenda of the 
talk was then outlined, which was to discuss the key components and 
skills required for a successful career as an actuary and provide 
information about WTW. 
 
Garima and Priyanka began by defining what an actuary is and the path to 
becoming one. They explained that an actuary is a business professional 
who uses their knowledge of mathematics, statistics, and finance to assess 
the financial impact of risks and uncertainties. They then provided 
insights into the skills required for a successful career as an actuary, such 
as critical thinking, problem-solving, communication, and the ability to 
work well in a team. 
 
They then shared their personal experiences as actuaries and provided a 
detailed explanation of the actuarial journey. They discussed the various 
stages of the journey, including completing the actuarial exams, obtaining 
practical experience, and obtaining professional certification. They 
emphasized the importance of continuous learning and development to 
stay relevant in the field. 
 
The talk also provided a view of what a successful career as an actuary 
looks like, highlighting the potential for career advancement, high earning 



potential, and the ability to make a positive impact on society. Gayathri 
and Vikky then give a detailed explanation about the profile offered I.e. 
provide a business overview of Insurance Consulting & Technology and 
Retirement Consulting. They highlighted the opportunities for growth and 
development, the collaborative and supportive work culture, and the 
challenging and intellectually stimulating work. 
 
After providing The business overview the panel discussed about the 
selection procedure that is to be followed and all the queries were 
answered by the speakers. 
 
The pre-placement talk by WTW was an informative session that ended at 
12:30 pm. Overall, the event was well-received by the students, who left 
with a better understanding of the actuarial career and the potential 
opportunities available to them in the field. 
 

 
 



 
 

 
 



 


